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Gist of proceedings of the 14th Annual General Meeting of Den Networks Limited 

A. Date, time and venue of the Annual General Meeting (Meeting): 

The 14th Annual General Meeting of the Company was held on Friday, September 17, 2021 

through Video Conferencing ("VC"). The Meeting commenced at 4:00 p.m. (1ST) and 

concluded at 4:37 p.rn. (1ST). 

B. Proceedings in brief: 

• Shri Sarneer Manchanda-Chairman, chaired the Meeting. He informed that due to pre­
occupation, Mr. Anuj Jain, Non-Executive Director could not attend the meeting. 

• The Chairman informed that the Meeting was held through VC in compliance with the 
circulars issued by the Ministry of Corporate Affairs, Government of India and the 
Securities and Exchange Board of India. 

• The requisite quorum being present, the Chairman called the Meeting to order. 

• The Chairman addressed the members. 

• The Chairman informed that remote e-voting commenced at 9:00 a.m. (1ST) on Monday, 
September 13, 2021 and concluded at 5:00 p.m. (1ST) on Thursday, September 16, 2021. 

• The Chairman also informed the members that Shri Neelesh Kumar Jain, Practicing 
Company Secretary, Proprietor, N.K.J. & Associates, Company Secretaries, was appointed 
as the Scrutiniser to scrutinise the voting through electronic means (i.e. remote e-voting 
and voting at the meeting through electronic voting system). 

• The following items of business as set out in the Notice convening the 14th Annual General 
Meeting were commended for members' consideration and approval: 

Ordinary Business 

I. Consideration and adoption of (a) the audited financial statement of the Company for the 
financial year ended March 31, 2021 and the Reports of the Board of Directors and Auditors 
thereon; and (b) the audited consolidated financial statement of the Company for the 
financial year ended March 31, 2021 and the report of Auditors thereon. 

2. Appointment of Ms. Geeta Fulwadaya, a Director retiring by rotation. 

Special Business 

3. Ratification of the remuneration of the Cost Auditors, for the financial year ending March 
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• The Chairman informed the members that the voting results (remote e-voting and voting at 
the meeting through electronic voting system) shall be disseminated to the stock exchanges 
and also uploaded on the website of the Company and KFin Technologies Private Limited 
(KFin), the authorized agency which provided e-voting facility. 

C. Voting by Members: 

• The Company had provided remote e-voting facility to its members to cast votes 
electronically on all 3 items of business set out in the Notice. 

• The facility to vote at the meeting, on all 3 items of business set out in the Notice, through 
electronic voting system (Insta Poll), was also made available to the members who 
participated in the meeting and had not cast their votes through remote e-voting. 

Notes: 

t. The,Company will separately intimate the voting result (remote e-voting and voting at the 
meeting through electronic voting system) to the stock exchanges. 

11 . This document does not constitute minutes of the proceedings of the Annual General 
Meeting of the Company. 
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